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EDITORIAL

questions about efficacy of the prophylactic dose of
vitamin K. It is a matter of speculation that multiple co-
morbid factors, maternal nutritional status or the antibiotic
itself may directly or indirectly affect the action of vitamin
K. It needs to be investigated whether such infants may
benefit from vitamin K at shorter intervals or higher
dosages due to pharmacogenetic variations or
polymorphism of genes for enzymes involved in vitamin k
dependent coagulation factors [8].

The question remains regarding the clinical
implications of this study [3]. Clinicians need to be aware
that vitamin K deficiency is ‘silent’ problem in
hospitalized newborn. Newborns on antibiotic therapy
develop subclinical vitamin K deficiency, which is usually
multifactorial and needs to be anticipated. PIVKA II is a
biomarker reflecting low vitamin K levels, but it lacks
normal reference range, and may not be directly associated
with VKDB. A correct prophylaxis should prevent vitamin
K deficiency, but the question of how best can we detect
this deficiency early remains unresolved. There are several
knowledge gaps in our understanding of the complex
interaction between vitamin K and antibiotics. Further
studies should attempt to investigate these complex
interactions so that clinical decisions about vitamin K
prophylaxis become evidence-based and not experience-
based, for experience is the ability to make the same
mistake again and again with increasing confidence.
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